
“I hope to give all my patients the
tools, knowledge, and support to
better manage their health
together.”

About Arathy Chandran, MD

Dr. Arathy Chandran has been
interested in healthcare for as long as
she can remember. “Working on
behalf of my patients is the greatest
joy of being a physician,” she says.
She strives to educate and empower
patients. “I hope to give all my
patients the tools, knowledge, and
support to better manage their health
together,” she says. She adds, “A
patient places a tremendous amount
of trust in a doctor, and so it is vital to
earn that trust.” She appreciates the
opportunity to “connect with and learn
from such a diverse group of people.”
I

n her free time, Dr. Chandran enjoys
spending time with family and friends
and studying Kathak, an Indian
classical dance. She also likes
watching science fiction and fantasy
movies.

Arathy Chandran, MD

LANGUAGES
SPOKEN
English
Malayalam

SPECIALTIES
Primary Care

EDUCATION
Malankara Orthodox Syrian Church
Medical College
Stony Brook University Hospital

ASSOCIATIONS
American Medical Association
American Academy of Family Physicians
American Board of Family Medicine

MY CENTER

Pembroke Pines

8529 Pines Boulevard, 
Pembroke Pines, FL, 33024 

(954) 704-3300

Request Appt.

View Center

tel:(954)%20704-3300
https://www.chenmedicalcenters.com/book-now?salesforcecenter=Pembroke%20Pines,%20FL&medicalCenterRecordInput=a0s4400000aTCPNAA4
https://www.chenmedicalcenters.com/find-a-location/broward-county/pembroke-pines

	Arathy Chandran, MD
	“I hope to give all my patients the tools, knowledge, and support to better manage their health together.”
	MY CENTER
	About Arathy Chandran, MD
	Pembroke Pines



